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1. Abstract
Syphilis is a chronic bacterial infection caused by Treponema pall-
idum. Syphilitic lesions may coexist with other sexually transmitted 
diseases, and their endoscopic features often overlap with those of  
inflammatory bowel disease, other infection types, and non-steroidal 
anti-inflammatory drug enteropathy. 

Syphilitic proctitis is rarely reported but is being recognized more 
frequently because of  the increased incidence of  syphilis. The ob-
jective of  our study is to alarm clinicians to consider the possibility 
of  syphilitic proctitis in high-risk patients. Here, we report a case of  
syphilitic proctitis in 36-year-old women that presented with diffuse 
rectal ulceration mimicking ulcerative colitis. The patient was treat-
ed with intramuscular penicillin G benzathine, 2.4 million units per 
week for 3 weeks and the results were spectacular after a few weeks 
of  treatment.

The diagnosis of  syphilitic proctitis is then an entity difficult to di-
agnose and therefore to take care of  correctly as soon as possible, 
hence the interest of  a reminder of  the treatment with review of  the 
literature to improve the care of  these patients

2. Introduction
Syphilis which is caused by Treponema pallidum infections, it affects 
a multiple variety of  organs. Infections involving the skin, genitals, 
retina, and central nervous system are commonly described; rarely, 
unusual manifestations, of  the gastrointestinal tract can also occur 
[1].

Syphilitic proctitis is a rare entity. It usually presents as proctitis, ulcer 
or neoplasm but lacks pathognomonic clinical symptoms. It is, there-
fore, difficult to diagnosis and is often treated inappropriately. Here, 

we report a case of  syphilitic proctitis in a 36-year-old woman that 
presented with diffuse rectal ulceration mimicking ulcerative colitis 
[2].

3. Material and Methods
A 36-year-old women presented with a 6 months’ history of  diarrhea 
and occasional anal bleeding the patient had no particular patholog-
ical history other than unprotected sex with multiple partners [3-5]. 

4. Results
On clinical examination, the patient was conscious, hemodynamically 
and respiratory stable with a mucocutaneous palor; on rectal exam-
ination, the finger cot came back soiled with blood. On the cutane-
ous level, the patient presented a specific syphilitic chancre at the lev-
el of  the labia major without other associated clinic manifestations.

In the biological assessment: a microcytic hypochromic anemia was 
found with a hemoglobin level of  9.2 g / dl with a positive syphilit-
ic serology and negative HIV serology. At colonoscopy: the rectum 
presented deep well ulcerations with diffuse petechial lesions sug-
gesting ulcerative colitis and multiple biopsies were taken [6-9].

The pathological results of  the biopsy showed an abundant lympho-
cyte infiltrate with plasma cells and neutrophils with formation of  
lymphoid follicles and ulcerations, without heterotypic cells or signs 
of  malignancy. The patient was treated with IM penicillin G benza-
thine, 2.4 M. U per week for 3 weeks. One month after de diagnosis, 
the patient was asymptomatic and a repeat colonoscopy showed the 
previous ulcers completely cleared [10].

5. Discussion
The signs and symptoms of  proctitis may include rectal bleeding, rec-
tal pain with or without bowel movements passing of  mucus through 



             2

2021, V7(2): 1-2

https://jjgastrohepto.org/

the rectum, or a feeling of  rectal fullness. However, symptoms vary 
depending on the underlying etiology, but can be similar to lesions in 
inflammatory bowel disease. Radiation proctitis usually starts during 
radiation therapy and can last for months to years after treatment 
ends. Colitis with clostidium difficile, whether or not secondary to 
antibiotic therapy, can also present in the form of  rectal ulcerations, 
most often with deposition of  pseudomembranes. Eosinophilic 
proctitis occurs when eosinophils accumulate in the rectal lining, typ-
ically affecting only children that syphilis infections of  the stratified 
squamous epithelium are commonly seen in the perianal area and at 
the anal verge; however, our patient did not have these features. Dark 
field examinations and tests for T. pallidum in secretions or lesion 
tissues are definitive methods of  detecting syphilis. However, the low 
availability of  Dark field microscopes and the expertise to use them 
limits the identification of  the Treponeme. Alternatives for the direct 
detection of  T. pallidum are fluorescence microscopy and nucleic 
acid amplification. Nevertheless, syphilis remains a difficult diagnosis 
to demonstrate by histological examinations by staining with hema-
toxylin and eosin or by staining of  Warthin-Starry. Thus, serological 
testing remains the most common method for syphilis screening, 
diagnosis, and treatment determination. Specific immunohistochem-
ical staining for T [11-12]. pallidum is a more sensitive and specific 
method than the standard Warthin-Starry staining method for the 
detection of  spirochetes. Hoang et al. reported a 71% sensitivity for 
IHC, compared with 41% for silver staining; false positives were also 
absent among the control specimens. The use of  specific T. pallidum 
antibodies, as used in the present case, also drastically reduces back-
ground interference. In our case, intra- and extracellular spiral and 
threadlike microorganisms were identified under a direct microscope, 
thus making the diagnosis of  syphilitic proctitis. Thus, the combina-
tion of  colonoscopy and IHC was essential for the definitive diagno-
sis of  the patient. Syphilitic proctitis remains rare in the general pop-
ulation but is becoming increasingly common due to the increasing 
incidence of  syphilis in subjects with risky sexual behavior. Patients 
may complain of  hematochezia, urgency, diarrhea, or constipation. 
The endoscopic appearance of  the rectal area may include diffuse 
edema, erythema, multiple friable erosions, or ulceration. These fea-
tures are similar to those of  lesions due to inflammatory bowel dis-
ease, other infection types, and non-steroidal anti-inflammatory drug 
enteropathy. Regardless, clinicians should consider the possibility of  
syphilitic proctitis, especially in high-risk patients. Penicillin has long 
been the drug of  choice for syphilis treatment; at present, long-acting 
benzylpenicillin is the most commonly recommended therapy and 
was effective in the present case for a period of  3 weeks.

6. Conclusion
Syphilitic proctitis should be suspected in the event of  any isolated 
proctitis progressing in a patient with risky sexual behavior. Histo-
pathology remains non-pathognomonic, and specific serology and 
staining are essential to make the diagnosis. Thus, the diagnosis may 

be delayed, leading to potentially fatal consequences. Simple treat-
ment with benzatin penicillus G is sufficient to treat syphilitic proc-
titis once diagnosed.
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Figure 1: fragile erythematous mucosa with deep ulcers on colonoscopy

Figure 2: colonoscopic images of  diffuse petechial lesions in the rectum
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